
$332,000 - 5912 Berriweather Drive, Austin
MLS® #4852706 

$332,000
4 Bedroom, 3.00 Bathroom, 2,292 sqft
Residential on 0.13 Acres

TIERMO, Austin, TX

Modern East Austin Home in Tiermo â€“
Roomy, Stylish & Priced to Sell!

Welcome to 5912 Berriweather, a spacious
two-story home nestled in the popular Tiermo
community in East Austin. With nearly 2,300
square feet of living space, this home offers
room to spread out and enjoy.

Inside, youâ€™ll find two separate living
areas, perfect for entertaining, relaxing, or
setting up a home office or playroom. The
modern open-concept layout is anchored by
beautiful luxury vinyl plank flooring and a
stylish kitchen featuring granite countertops
and modern appliances.

Upstairs, the generously sized bedrooms
provide plenty of comfort and flexibility. Step
outside to a private backyardâ€”ideal for
gatherings, pets, or enjoying your morning
coffee in peace.

Located just minutes from local schools,
shopping, dining, and major highways, this
home offers both convenience and value.
Priced to sell, this is a fantastic opportunity to
own in one of Austinâ€™s fastest-growing
areas. Donâ€™t miss it!

Built in 2021

Essential Information



MLS® # 4852706

Price $332,000

Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 3.00

Full Baths 3

Square Footage 2,292

Acres 0.13

Year Built 2021

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Status Active

Community Information

Address 5912 Berriweather Drive

Area 3E

Subdivision TIERMO

City Austin

County Travis

State TX

Zip Code 78724

Amenities

Utilities Electricity Available

Features None

Parking Attached

Garage Spaces 2

View None

Waterfront None

Interior

Interior Carpet, Vinyl

Appliances Dishwasher, Disposal, Microwave, Free-Standing Range

Heating Central

Fireplaces None

# of Stories 2

Stories Two

Exterior

Exterior Features Rain Gutters



Lot Description Sprinklers In Rear, Sprinklers In Front, Trees Small Size

Roof Composition

Construction Frame, Masonry, Brick Veneer

Foundation Slab

School Information

District Del Valle ISD

Elementary Gilbert

Middle Dailey

High Del Valle

Additional Information

Date Listed April 7th, 2025

Days on Market 190

RE / Bank Owned Yes

Listing Details

Listing Office Spyglass Realty
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