
$295,000 - 180 Firebush Way, Buda
MLS® #7057021 

$295,000
3 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,506 sqft
Residential on 0.15 Acres

Green Meadows Sec 2a, Buda, TX

SELLER FINANCING AVAILABLE! $19,590 in
RECENT UPGRADES. Take advantage of an
incredibly low 2.25% interest rate on the
existing loan â€” ask agent for details. This
beautifully updated 3 bed, 2 bath home in the
highly desirable Green Meadows
neighborhood is move-in ready and full of
charm. Step inside to a bright, open floor plan
with tons of natural light and premium vinyl
plank flooring throughoutâ€”NO carpet
anywhere! The spacious kitchen has been
refreshed with new countertops, modern
backsplash, updated cabinets and hardware,
stainless steel appliances, an island, and a
brand new dishwasher. The primary suite
features a jetted tub, separate shower, double
vanity, and walk-in closet. Guest bedrooms
also feature upgraded flooring for a seamless
look. Fresh paint inside and out (2023) gives
this home a crisp, clean feel. Enjoy upgraded
ceiling fans, a new kitchen exhaust fan, and
landscaped curb appeal. The backyard offers
a covered patio and fenced yardâ€”perfect for
relaxing or entertaining. Three sides masonry.
Located in Hays CISD with easy access to
I-35, parks, shopping, dining, and more.
Donâ€™t miss this one!

Built in 2008

Essential Information

MLS® # 7057021

Price $295,000



Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 2.00

Full Baths 2

Square Footage 1,506

Acres 0.15

Year Built 2008

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Status Active

Community Information

Address 180 Firebush Way

Area HH

Subdivision Green Meadows Sec 2a

City Buda

County Hays

State TX

Zip Code 78610

Amenities

Utilities Electricity Available, Natural Gas Available

Features Common Grounds/Area, Community Mailbox, Park

Parking Attached

Garage Spaces 2

View None

Waterfront None

Interior

Interior Vinyl

Appliances Dishwasher, Exhaust Fan, Free-Standing Range, Disposal, Stainless
Steel Appliance(s), Water Softener Owned

Heating Central, Electric

Fireplaces None

# of Stories 1

Stories One

Exterior

Exterior Features Private Yard, Rain Gutters

Lot Description Level, Trees Small Size



Roof Composition

Construction Brick, Masonry

Foundation Slab

School Information

District HaysCONSISD

Elementary Tom Green

Middle R C Barton

High Jack C Hays

Additional Information

Date Listed August 8th, 2025

Days on Market 67

Listing Details

Listing Office eXp Realty, LLC
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