
$449,990 - 148 Ginger Street, Buda
MLS® #9971765 

$449,990
3 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 2,350 sqft
Residential on 0.20 Acres

Sunfield Ph Five Sec Three, Buda, TX

Situated on a unique lot within Budaâ€™s
evolving landscape, 148 Ginger Street offers
2,350 square feet of thoughtfully crafted living
space. This 3-bedroom, 2-bathroom home,
complete with an office and dining area,
delivers the flexibility and functionality today's
buyers demandâ€”set within a community
poised for growth and opportunity. An open,
intuitive floor plan seamlessly connects the
living, dining, and kitchen spaces, with the
kitchen serving as a central hub for both
everyday living and effortless entertaining.
Built in 2023, the home features numerous
upgrades throughout, including a water
softener for enhanced comfort. The spacious
primary suite offers a private retreat, featuring
a large walk-in closet and a well-appointed
bath. Two additional bedrooms provide
versatility for family, guests, or
work-from-home needs. Outside, the backyard
is ready for your personal touchâ€”perfect for
relaxing, playing, or creating your dream
outdoor retreat. New trees and solar lighting
have been added to both the front and back
landscaping, enhancing the homeâ€™s
charm. Solar panels have also been installed,
significantly reducing electric bills for added
savings. The two-car garage includes epoxy
floors and plenty of space for parking and
storage. The current owners also offer a
complete gym setup, available for purchase
with the home if desired. As night falls,
permanent exterior lighting creates a magical
ambiance. Residents of this vibrant community



enjoy a wealth of amenities within walking
distance, including a community pool, a
brand-new lazy river, a park, a dog park, and
scenic walking trails. With immediate move-in
readiness and lasting potential, 148 Ginger
Street represents a smart investment in both
lifestyle and value. All values are approximate
and should be independently verified.

Built in 2023

Essential Information

MLS® # 9971765

Price $449,990

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 2.00

Full Baths 2

Square Footage 2,350

Acres 0.20

Year Built 2023

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Status Active

Community Information

Address 148 Ginger Street

Area HH

Subdivision Sunfield Ph Five Sec Three

City Buda

County Hays

State TX

Zip Code 78610

Amenities

Utilities Cable Available, Electricity Available, Natural Gas Available, Water
Available

Features Pet Amenities, Park, Pool, Trails/Paths

Parking Garage

Garage Spaces 2



View None

Waterfront None

Interior

Interior Carpet, Vinyl, Wood

Appliances Built-In Electric Oven, Built-In Gas Range, Dishwasher, Water Softener

Heating Central

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 1

Fireplaces Den

# of Stories 1

Stories One

Exterior

Exterior Features Lighting, Private Yard, Rain Gutters

Lot Description Landscaped, Private, Trees Small Size

Roof Shingle

Construction Brick, HardiPlank Type

Foundation Slab

School Information

District Hays CISD

Elementary Sunfield

Middle McCormick

High Johnson High School

Additional Information

Date Listed May 15th, 2025

Days on Market 151

Listing Details

Listing Office Keller Williams Realty
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